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CHEERLEADING CLOSEOUTS LAUNCHES WITH HUNDREDS OF 
BRANDED SPORTSWEAR PRODUCTS AVAILABLE AT UP TO 80% OFF 

Campus Teamwear announces the launch of their new outlet website, 
CheerleadingCloseouts.com, that will feature deals on new, high-quality 
cheerleading apparel and gear. 

San Diego, January 24, 2013 -- Cheerleaders can now find hundreds of bargains 
from leading sportswear brands at the new online store 
CheerleadingCloseouts.com, a division of industry leader Campus Teamwear. 
Campus Teamwear is a staple in the cheer apparel industry, and now they’ll use 
Cheerleading Closeouts to offer uniforms, shoes, bags, warmups and more gear 
at savings up to 80% off their everyday low prices. 
 
“Our new site is the best destination for cheerleaders looking for deals from top 
brands,” commented Jessica Rzeszut, Marketing Manager at Campus 
Teamwear. “Customers will have access to wide variety of in-stock, high-quality 
cheer gear and apparel at an exceptional value. These products aren’t damaged 
or second-hand. They are new items from popular cheer brands like Soffe, 
Chassé, Nike, Adidas and more.” 
 
Cheerleading Closeouts will also offer a different shipping model than its parent 
site, giving customers a set price of $3.97 for shipping for their entire order. 
 
“The new site will provide customers with last chance bargains, and will be 
adding new items throughout the season each year,” said Campus Teamwear 
Web Director Kevin Oskow. “Quantities will be limited, so it’s best to check the 
site often, and to sign up for our emails to get notifications about new products.” 

The new site is now live and accepting orders. All sales are final, and the colors 
and quantities are limited so shop early and shop often to get the best deals. 

### 

About Campus Teamwear 



Low price leader Campus Teamwear has been meeting the needs of the 
cheerleading industry for over 20 years by offering an extensive selection of  
in-stock uniforms and apparel, shoes, accessories, performance makeup and 
more. If you have any questions, please contact us at 1-800-871-0063 or email 
us at customerservice@cheerleadingonline.com.  
 
About Cheerleading Closeouts 
Cheerleading Closeouts launched in 2013, and is a division of Campus 
Teamwear. The website offers a wide variety of in-stock, high-quality cheer gear 
and apparel on final sale and available in limited color options and quantities at 
an exceptional value. 
 


